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In 1906, I was barely over fourteen years old, and it was my wedding day. My older sister, Helen, came to
my room, took me by the hand, and sat me down on the bed. She opened her mouth to say something, but
then her face flushed, and she turned her head to look out the window. After a second, she squeezed my hand
and looked back in my eyes. She said, “You’ve always been a good girl, Maude, and done what I told you.
Now, you’re going to be a married woman, and he will be the head of the house. When you go home tonight
after your party, no matter what he wants to do to you, you have to let him do it. Do you understand?”
I didn’t understand, but I nodded my head anyway. It sounded strange to me, the way so many things did. I
would do what she told me. I didn’t have a choice, any more than I had a choice in being born.
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From reader reviews:

Ryan Mendoza:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you is you don't know what one you should start with. This Maude is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

Donald Sigman:

The publication with title Maude posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of
the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on
the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Brent Campbell:

Often the book Maude has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book
was authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research just before write this book. This
kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after scanning this book.

Refugio Kennedy:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't work this
is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside appearance
likes. Maybe you answer might be Maude why because the amazing cover that make you consider
concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside
or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.
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