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Twelve-year-old Poppy is an orphan living in a bad neighborhood in Chicago, pick pocketing so that she has
a place to sleep at night. Justin’s world couldn’t be more different—his father owns a jewelry store—but
when he and Poppy meet, they become fast friends, thanks in part to Justin’s sweet pet goat. Through their
friendship, Poppy realizes that she doesn’t want to be a thief anymore and she begins to feel like she may
have a place with Justin’s family. But when Justin makes an expensive mistake at his father’s store, Poppy is
immediately blamed. In response, she flees . . . right into the Great Chicago Fire.

Poppy and Justin must rely on their instincts if they are going to survive the catastrophe. Will anything be
left when the fire finally burns out?
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From reader reviews:

Ella Butler:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to you is you don't know which one you should start with. This Firestorm! is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in
this era.

William Stewart:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Firestorm! which is finding the
e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Yolanda Powers:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can know
everything you want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This reserve Firestorm! was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add
your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a book. If
you know how big benefit from a book, you can experience enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Wanda Hardin:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just in search of the Firestorm! when you essential it?
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