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Humorous and witty recollections of the author’s journey from insecure graduate student to noted activist-
scholar.

How does a graduate student acquire the skills necessary to define a clear research agenda and write
meaningful contributions to the scholarship in his or her field? Can the requirements of professional
advancement in the ivory tower be reconciled with making a difference in the bare-knuckle world of
policymaking? Can even a celebrated activist-scholar survive the seemingly relentless neoliberalization of
higher education? Becoming a Footnote takes the reader on an inspirational journey through the experiences
of researcher Sanford F. Schram, illuminating how he overcame his early insecurities and limitations,
particularly about his writing, to develop into someone cited by both scholars and people involved in the
policymaking process. With wit and humor, Schram illustrates how his award-winning research on race,
poverty, and welfare emerged from the political struggles in which he was immersed, and how we all have
something unique to contribute if we commit ourselves to making it happen.

“For those who know of the author’s work, this book provides a revealing glimpse into the man behind the
reputation. But, even for those unfamiliar with it, Becoming a Footnote is a highly readable and engaging
account of a life’s work that would be of interest to anyone pursuing an academic position, including those
who wonder how to remain real and relevant from inside academia.” — Vicki Lens, Columbia University

“This book drew me in and works as a narrative on two levels. First, it is disarmingly and convincingly self-
deprecating about the struggle to become a critical thinker, to write well, and to devise research programs
that would shed light on major questions. Second, it is a valuable history of the central debates around social
welfare policy, neoliberalism, and racial stigma.” — James Scott, author of The Art of Not Being Governed:
An Anarchist History of Upland Southeast Asia
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From reader reviews:

Sophia Hartman:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Becoming a Footnote: An Activist-Scholar Finds His Voice, Learns
to Write, and Survives Academia (SUNY series in New Political Science). Try to make the book Becoming a
Footnote: An Activist-Scholar Finds His Voice, Learns to Write, and Survives Academia (SUNY series in
New Political Science) as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel
alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you
personally. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we
need to make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Leonard Bartow:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book that will
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of guide you read, if you
want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one with theme for
entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Becoming a Footnote: An Activist-Scholar Finds His
Voice, Learns to Write, and Survives Academia (SUNY series in New Political Science) is kind of book
which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Thomas Brown:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top record in your reading list is usually Becoming a Footnote: An Activist-Scholar Finds His
Voice, Learns to Write, and Survives Academia (SUNY series in New Political Science). This book and that
is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Carol Wells:

You may get this Becoming a Footnote: An Activist-Scholar Finds His Voice, Learns to Write, and Survives
Academia (SUNY series in New Political Science) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or
reviewing it might to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are
various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the
modern era like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange



yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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